RFB 2012-112: Road Materials

Approved by CC:

Recap Sheet FEB 112 013
Opening Date: March 21, 2012, 2:00 p.m., at Johnson County Purchasing Office A Gue C.Dg\?u
Vendor 1 Vendor 2 Vendor 3 Vendor 4 Vendor 5
Vendor Name Heartland Asphalt Ingram Concrete, Inc | Trinity Materials, Inc | Squaw Creek Materials | Fort Worth Crushed
Stone
Address Hurst, TX Cleburne, TX Ferris, TX Rainbow, TX Fort Worth, TX
Pickup/FOB Pickup/FOB Pickup/FOB Pickup/FOB Pickup/FOB
Hot Mix (334) NO BID / / / /
Type F
Hot Mix (334) NO BID / / / /
Type AC 1.5
HMAC (340) NO BID / / / /
Type B
HMAC (340) NO BID
Type D
Riprap, Type R NO BID / / / $11.00/ no FOB
{non-spec)
Riprap, Type F NO BID / / / /
Surf Agg, Type A, NO BID “4” torpedo gravel @ / / /
Grade 4 $6.50/ton
Surf Agg, Type A, NO BID / / / /
Grade §
Weather Lime NO BID / / / /
3/8” Pea Gravel NO BID $9.50/ton $8.00 / n/a / /
(if available)
Flex, Grade 1 NO BID / / $6.00/ton / $4.05/no FOB
$.225/mile/ton Item 242, Grade 2
Cresson Plant
Flex, Grade 2 NO BID / / $6.00/ton / $5.15/n0 FOB
$.225/mile/ton (W’ford Plant)
Flex, Grade 3 NO BID / / / $5.15/n0 FOB
(W’ford Plant)
RB Lime Waste NO BID / / / /




Surf Agg, Type B,
Grade 4

NO BID

/

/

/

Surf Agg, Type B,
Grade §

NO BID

/

/

/

Sand Concrete

NO BID

$9.00/ton

$8.00/ n/a

$5.50/ton /
$.225/mile/ton

Coat Rock PB3

NO BID

/

Coat Rock PB4

NO BID

HP Cold Mix

NO BID

Port Type I/II

NO BID

Min. Order

24 tons delivered

Other Fees

Call office for current
FOB rates

Original & 5 copies

References

Y
N

Z|=<

=<

Residence
Certificate

v

Financial Statement

z

W9 Form
Insurance (Opt)
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=< Z =<

<l Z| < Z|=<

Attest: Pam Causey, Asst. Purchasing Agent, Patrick Coyle of Heartland Asphalt, Heather Carmichael, Buyer




Vendor 6 Vendor 7 Vendor 8 Vendor 9 Vendor 10
Vendor Name Rattler Rock, Inc Vulcan Materials, Co | Arnold Crushed Stone | Little Bear Aggregate Mills Crushed Stone
Address Blum, TX Fort Worth, TX Blum, TX Cresson, TX Nemo, TX
Pickup/FOB Pickup/FOB Pickup/FOB Pickup/FOB Pickup/FOB

Hot Mix (334) / / / /

Type F

Hot Mix (334) $68.00/ .20 / / /

Type AC 1.5 As TxDOT T4

D+HMCL

HMAC (340) $70.00/ .22 / / /

Type B

HMAC (340) $70.00/ .22

Type D

Riprap, Type R / $18.00/ton FOB / $12.00/ton
(FOB no bid)

Riprap, Type F / $18.00/ton FOB / $12.00/ton
(FOB no bid)

Surf Agg, Type A, $18.00/ .20 / / /

Grade 4

Surf Agg, Type A, $8.50/.20 / / /

Grade 5 Doesn’t meet TxDOT

Item 316

Weather Lime / / / /

3/8” Pea Gravel / / / /

Flex, Grade 1 $ 5.00/ton $6.50/ .20 $5.35/ton FOB / $4.25/ton
(FOB no bid)

Flex, Grade 2 NOT GRADED $6.50/.20 $5.15/ton FOB $5.00/ton $4.25/ton

Has 1-3 & 3-5 (FOB no bid)
screened for $6.00/ton

Flex, Grade 3 / $5.15/ton FOB $5.00/ton $4.25/ton
(FOB no bid)

RB Lime Waste / / / $3.00/ton
(FOB no bid)

Surf Agg, Type B, $20.00/ .20 / / /




Grade 4

Surf Agg, Type B,
Grade 5

$8.50/.20
Doesn’t meet TxDOT
Item 302 GR-2

Sand Concrete

/

Coat Rock PB3

$40.00/ .20

Coat Rock PB4

$40.00/ .20

HP Cold Mix

/

Port Type I/I1

/

Min. Order

25 tons

6 tons

Other Fees

Original & 5 copies

References

Residence
Certificate

Financial Statement

W9 Form
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Vendor 11

Vendor 12

Vendor 13

Vendor 14

Vendor 15

Vendor Name

APAC- Texas, Inc

Reynolds Asphalt

TXI

Address

Dallas, TX

Euless, TX

Dallas, TX

Pickup/FOB

Pickup/FOB

Pickup/FOB

Pickup/FOB

Pickup/FOB

Hot Mix (334)
Type F

$85.00/ton

/

/

/

/

Hot Mix (334)
Type AC 1.5

$85.00/ton

HMAC (340)
Type B

$56.00/ton

$54.00/ FOB .25 per
ton per mile

HMAC (340)
Type D

$58.00/ton

$55.00/ FOB .25 per
ton per mile

Riprap, Type R

/

Riprap, Type F

Surf Agg, Type A,
Grade 4

Surf Agg, Type A,
Grade 5

Weather Lime

3/8” Pea Gravel

Flex, Grade 1

Flex, Grade 2

$5.75/ton
FOB $17.50/ton

Flex, Grade 3

$5.75/ton
FOB $17.50/ton

RB Lime Waste

/

Surf Agg, Type B,
Grade 4

$12.50/ton
FOB $24.00/ton




Surf Agg, Type B,
Grade 5

$11.50/ton
FOB $23.00/ton

Sand Concrete

/

Coat Rock PB3 / /

Coat Rock PB4 / /

HP Cold Mix $105.00/ton / /

Port Type /11 / $140.00 bulk bag or

$95.00 spread /

FOB $149.00 bag del
or $112.50 spread del.

Min. Order 24 ton for delivery 22 ton min w/ No min; all freight

Flowboys charged @ full load
rate of 25 ton
Other Fees FOB: 1-10 mile = 24hr prior notice
$5.00/ton, add .25 per
ton per mile

Original & 5 copies Y Y Y

References Y Y Y

Residence Y Y Y

Certificate

Financial Statement Y N N

W9 Form Y Y Y




